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Vacation Care Flyer
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JOIN IN ON THE FUN
AND ADVENTURE

B O O K  N O W !
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For service information

WHAT FOOD DO I PACK?

Morning Tea

Lunch

Afternoon Tea

WHAT ESSENTIALS DO I PACK? 

Broad Brim Hat

Water Bottle

Please wear enclosed shoes
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Dunc's Honey

Come and join us for this buzzing
adventure in this experience we get an

up-close look at these incredible insects
and the vital role they play!

Incursion Fee: $22.00

Mini MasterChef's

Challenge yourself to become the
ultimate MasterChef! We will cook,

complete challenges and design some
aprons for the service.

Archery Attack

We will go head-to-head in a series of
challenges that test their speed,

accuracy and ability to strategise in this
ultimate battle!

Incursion Fee: $28.00

Argh, Me Hearties!

Winter Wonderland

Today we "walk the plank" as we
transform OSHC into our very own
pirates ship where we complete a
treasure hunt to find the "loot"!

Step into our Winter Wonderland where
snowflakes sparkle and the adventures

never end. We will enjoy winter-themed
crafts, snowy games, cozy movie time,

and a warm treat or two!
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Mindfulness & Wellness

Take a deep breath and join us for a
calming, feel-good day focused on

relaxation, self-care, and inner peace!

When I Grow Up!
Come join us for a fun-filled day where
we can explore all kinds of cool jobs—
like firefighters, chefs, builders, artists,

and more. Do you know what you might
want to be when you grow up?

Butterfly Kidz

Come along and be immersed in this
interactive butterfly house and learn about

all things butterflies!

Incursion Fee: $22.00

Baby Animals Petting Zoo

Bushland Creations & Dance

Get up close with adorable chicks, fluffy
bunnies, cuddly guinea pigs and lambs

while learning all about their care.

Incursion Fee: $25.00

We explore the beauty of Australia's
flora, fauna and Indigenous culture in this

hands-on workshop. Learn about
traditional art, storytelling and dance!

Incursion Fee: $22.00


